
Susanto B. Sulistyo <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>

Re: FR-2019-410 - Article Published
4 messages

Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com> Thu, Feb 20, 2020 at 7:33 PM
To: susanto sulistyo <susanto.sulistyo@gmail.com>
Cc: "pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com" <pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com>, "Susanto B. Sulistyo" <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>

Dear Dr Susanto,

Your manuscript is currently available online and in press on our website https://www.myfoodresearch.com. 
Please note that the version in press is the 'Corrected Proof' version. The manuscript informa�on e.g. volume, issue, page number and DOI, will
be provided once we have received the payment. We will then inform you of the update of your manuscript details. 

Thank you for your fine contribu�on. We hope that you con�nue to submit other ar�cles to the Journal. 

Thanks & Regards, 
Vivian New
Editor
Food Research

From: susanto sulistyo <susanto.sulistyo@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 20 February, 2020 12:08 PM
To: Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com>
Cc: pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com <pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com>; Susanto B. Sulistyo <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>
Subject: Re: FR-2019-410 - Ar�cle Produc�on
 
Dear Vivian

Thank you for your email.
We have checked the galley proof of the manuscript and we found no mistakes in it.
We will complete the payment as soon as possible.

Regards
Susanto

On Wed, Feb 19, 2020 at 7:58 PM Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com> wrote:
Dear Dr Sulistyo,

Please refer to the a�achment for the galley proof of your manuscript FR-2019-410 en�tled 'Regression analysis for determina�on of
an�oxidant ac�vity of coconut sap under various hea�ng temperature and concentra�on of lysine addi�on' . Please check the content of the
galley proof. If there are any mistakes, please comment and highlight in the PDF itself and revert to us within two (2) days of receipt. Once we
have finalized the PDF version, your manuscript will be published online for early viewing. 

Please see the a�achment for the invoice INV20036. We hope that you can make the payment as soon as possible before 11 March 2020 for us
to complete the publica�on of your manuscript. The manuscript informa�on e.g. volume, issue, page numbers and DOI, will be provided once
we have received the payment. 

Thanks & Regards, 
Vivian New
Editor
Food Research

From: susanto sulistyo <susanto.sulistyo@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, 15 February, 2020 5:19 AM
To: Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com>
Cc: Susanto B. Sulistyo <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>; pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com <pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com>
Subject: Re: FR-2019-410 - Ar�cle Produc�on
 
Dear Vivian New

I apologize for the mistake. I put some uncited references but they have now been deleted from the reference list.
Please find the attached file of the revised manuscript.
Thank you.

Regards
Susanto

On Fri, Feb 14, 2020 at 3:26 PM Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com> wrote:
Dear Dr Susanto, 

Manuscript ID: FR-2019-410
Manuscript Title: Regression analysis for determina�on of an�oxidant ac�vity of coconut sap under various hea�ng temperature and
concentra�on of lysine addi�on
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Before we can proceed with the ar�cle produc�on, I would like to clarify a few points that I have commented in the manuscript. Please refer
to the a�achment. Please address the issues raised in the comments.

Please use the a�ached copy to make your revisions as it has been corrected to the Journal's format. Once you have done, kindly revert the
copy to me as soon as possible. Please note the faster you respond, the quicker we will process your manuscript. 

Thanks & Regards, 
Vivian New
Editor
Food Research

From: susanto sulistyo <susanto.sulistyo@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 4 February, 2020 11:00 PM
To: foodresearch.my@outlook.com <foodresearch.my@outlook.com>
Cc: Susanto B. Sulistyo <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>
Subject: Re: FR-2019-410 - Decision on your manuscript
 
Dear Dr. Vivian New

Please find the a�ached Ar�cle Processing Fee form.
I reply your message using my gmail account as somehow my message using my ins�tu�onal email address has been blocked.

Thank you.

Kind regards
Susanto

On Tue, Feb 4, 2020 at 9:49 PM Susanto B. SULISTYO <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com>
Date: Fri, Jan 31, 2020 at 3:43 PM
Subject: Re: FR-2019-410 - Decision on your manuscript
To: Susanto B. SULISTYO <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>
Cc: pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com <pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com>

Dear Dr. Sulistyo, 

It is a pleasure to accept your manuscript for publica�on in Food Research journal. Please refer to the a�achment for your acceptance
le�er. 

Please note that all accepted manuscripts are subjected to Article Processing Charges (APC) as the Journal will provide full
publishing services. Please fill in the article processing fee form attached with this letter and revert to us within five (5) working
days. Once we have received the form, your article will be transferred to production. 

Thank you for your fine contribu�on. We look forward to your con�nued contribu�ons to the Journal. 

Sincerely, 
Dr. Vivian New
Editor
Food Research

From: Susanto B. SULISTYO <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 January, 2020 3:05 PM
To: Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com>
Cc: pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com <pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com>
Subject: Re: FR-2019-410
 
Dear Prof Dr Son Radu
Chief Editor, Food Research

Firstly, we would like to thank the Chief Editor and all reviewers for critically reviewing our paper and pointing out ways to improve the technicality and
readability aspects of this paper. In the revised paper attached, the revisions made appear in blue. We have also fulfilled the Author's Section in the
Evaluation Form. 
Thank you.

Kind regards
Susanto

On Tue, Jan 21, 2020 at 4:39 PM Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com> wrote:
Dear Sulistyo,

Manuscript FR-2019-410 entitled " Regression Analysis for Determination of Antioxidant Activity of Coconut Sap Under Various
Heating Temperature and Concentration of Lysine Addition " which you submitted to Food Research, has been reviewed. The
comments of the reviewer(s) are included in the attached file.
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The reviewer(s) have recommended publication, but also suggest some revisions to your manuscript.  Therefore, I invite you
to respond to the reviewer(s)' comments and revise your manuscript. Once the revised manuscript is prepared, please send it
back to me for further processing.

Because we are trying to facilitate timely publication of manuscripts submitted to Food Research, your revised manuscript
should be submitted before or by 21st February 2020.  If it is not possible for you to submit your revision by this date, please
let us know.

Once again, thank you for submitting your manuscript to Food Research and I look forward to receiving your revised
manuscript.

Sincerely,
Professor Dr. Son Radu
foodresearch.my@outlook.com
 
Chief Editor, Food Research
 

 

--
Susanto Budi Sulistyo, Ph.D
Head of Agricultural Engineering Study Program
Member of Laboratory of Farm Machinery
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Jl. Dr. Soeparno, Karangwangkal, Purwokerto, Indonesia
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--
Susanto Budi Sulistyo, Ph.D
Head of Agricultural Engineering Study Program
Member of Laboratory of Farm Machinery
Department of Agricultural Technology
Faculty of Agriculture
Jenderal Soedirman University
Jl. Dr. Soeparno, Karangwangkal, Purwokerto, Indonesia
Email: susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id
           susanto.sulistyo@gmail.com
           susanto_sulistyo@yahoo.com
Phone: (+62) 812-2541-7015

Susanto B. SULISTYO <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id> Wed, Mar 4, 2020 at 1:26 PM
To: Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com>

Dear Vivian New

We have completed the payment of our paper with manuscript ID: FR-2019-410 and invoice number: INV20036.
Please find attached the payment receipt.
Also please let me know if you have received the payment.
Thank you.

Kind regards
Susanto

[Quoted text hidden]

Payment proof FR-2019-410 (INV20036).jpg
290K

Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com> Thu, Mar 5, 2020 at 8:10 PM
To: "Susanto B. SULISTYO" <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>

Dear Dr Sulistyo, 

Thank you for the payment.
Kindly be informed that your manuscript has been assigned to Food Research 2020, Vol. 4, Issue 4 (August 2020). Your manuscript is currently
available online and in press on our website https://www.myfoodresearch.com. Alterna�vely, you can download a copy of the manuscript by
clicking on the following link:
https://doi.org/10.26656/fr.2017.4(4).410

We encourage you to share your published work with your colleagues. Thank you for your fine contribu�on. We hope that you con�nue to
submit other ar�cles to the Journal. 

Thanks & Regards, 
Dr. Vivian New
Editor
Food Research

From: Susanto B. SULISTYO <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id>
Sent: Wednesday, 4 March, 2020 2:26 PM
To: Food Research <foodresearch.my@outlook.com>
Subject: Re: FR-2019-410 - Ar�cle Published
 
[Quoted text hidden]

Susanto B. SULISTYO <susanto.sulistyo@unsoed.ac.id> Thu, Mar 5, 2020 at 8:21 PM
To: pita_thpunsoed@yahoo.com

Susanto B. Sulistyo, PhD
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