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Call for Paper: Journal of Positive Psychology and Wellbeing

Journal Of Positive Psychology and Well being < jppweditor@gmail.com > Mon, Jan 31, 2022 at 9:35 PM
To: adhi.2005unsoed@gmail.com

Dear Researchers,

It is an honor to invite you for our upcoming issue in Journal of Positive Psychology and Wellbeing (ISSN 2587-0130) Scopus

Q2.

Journal of Positive Psychology and Wellbeing (ISSN 2587-0130) is a peer-reviewed journal covering positive psychology and
provides an international forum for the science of positive psychology in education and school settings. The JPPW, is an open-
access that publishes research outcomes with significant contributions to the understanding and improvement of the positive
psychology of education and services in school settings. The journal encompasses a full range of methodologies and orientations
that include educational, cognitive, social, behavioral, preventive, cross-cultural, management and developmental perspectives.

Papers should be under scope and plagiarism should be less than 20%. Papers will be published within Four (02) months and

publication fee is 870 Euros.

Kind regards,

Editorial Team

Journal of Positive Psychology and Wellbeing

Journal URL: https://journalppw.com/index.php/JPPW

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21100983356#tabs=0

Scimagojr link- https://www.scimagojr.com/journalsearch.php?q=21100983356&tip=sid&exact=no
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M Gmall Adhi Iman <adhi.2005unsoed@gmail.com>

Manuscript submitted

Adhi Iman <adhi.2005unsoed@gmail.com> Mon, Feb 1, 2022 at 08:21 AM
To: JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com>

Dear Editorial Team

We have submitted an article manuscript. We hope that our manuscript can be processed further and qualify for
the journal.

Sincerely

Adhi Iman Sulaiman
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M Gmall Adhi Iman <adhi.2005unsoed@gmail.com>

Manuscript submitted

JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> Fri, Mar 12, 2022 at 07:10 AM
To: Adhi Iman <adhi.2005unsoed@gmail.com>

Dear Researchers,

Based on the review results from the editor and reviewer, we declare that your manuscript can be continued for the
revision process. Please revise the article manuscript regarding the novelty of the research more sharply,
theoretical citations and discussions more reference citations, and grammar to be double-checked to make it more
effective.

Kind regards,

Editorial Team

Journal of Positive Psychology and Wellbeing

Journal URL: https://journalppw.com/index.php/JPPW

Scopus URL: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21100983356#tabs=0

Scimagojr link- https://www.scimagojr.com/journalsearch.php?q=21100983356&tip=sid&exact=no
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M Gmall Adhi Iman <adhi.2005unsoed @gmail.com>

Revised Manuscript
Adhi Iman <adhi.2005unsoed@gmail.com> Mon, Mar 29, 2022 at 09:15 AM
To: JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com>
Dear Editorial Team
We have submitted the revised manuscript in accordance with the suggestions of the editors and reviewers. Please
confirm the continuation process of our manuscript.
Sincerely

Adhi Iman Sulaiman

I5@JPPW Sulaiman et al (2021).docx
126K
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M Gmail Adhi Iman <adhi.2005unsoed@gmail.com>

Fwd: You have paid for 'Publica. (USD 550/ INR 40500)' on Instamojo

Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id>
To: adhi.2005unsoed@gmail.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com>

Date: Sab, 9 Apr 2022 pukul 13.22

Subject: Re: You have paid for 'Publica. (USD 550/ INR 40500)' on Instamojo
To: Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id>

Its ok sir. It will be uploaded on website and you can use this pdf file, because journal is not open Access.

On 09-Apr-2022, at 10:33 AM, Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id> wrote:
Dear: Editor Team Journal of Positive Psychology & Wellbeing

We have edited again according to the suggestion to create a PDF format. We have removed the academic title in the author's name to make it better, including re-editing tabl
with the margins of the article template. Please this last submitted article published in a journal.

Thank you for your attention and support.

Best regards
Adhi Iman Sulaiman
Pada tanggal Jum, 8 Apr 2022 pukul 12.43 JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> menulis:

These are word file in proper template, please do changes and make pdf,
Then send us for replacement.

On 08-Apr-2022, at 4:00 AM, Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

Dari: Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id>

Date: Kam, 7 Apr 2022 pukul 06.46

Subject: Re: You have paid for 'Publica. (USD 550/ INR 40500)' on Instamojo
To: JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com>

Dear: Editor Team Journal of Positive Psychology & Wellbeing

We have edited the author's name without using an academic degree to make it better, including the writing on the table so that the indicators in the right column are cle
in a journal.

Thank you for your attention and support.

Best regards
Adhi Iman Sulaiman

Pada tanggal Kam, 7 Apr 2022 pukul 01.45 JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> menulis:
Dear Author
Please find the revised pdf and check same link ,
Authors name updated.

On 06-Apr-2022, at 6:16 PM, JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> wrote:

We will do corrections tomorrow and send you new pdf.
On 06-Apr-2022, at 5:51 PM, Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id> wrote:
Dear JPPW Editorial Board
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We apologize for not including the author's name, because at the beginning usually submissions for articles are always asked for a blank author first.

Thanks for the wisdom.

Best regards
Dr. Adhi Iman Sulaiman

Pada tanggal Rab, 6 Apr 2022 pukul 17.44 JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> menulis:
Its ok. We will do corrections soon.

On 06-Apr-2022, at 3:27 PM, JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> wrote:

But why you earlier not given authors name.

On 06-Apr-2022, at 3:18 PM, Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id> wrote:

Dear JPPW Editorial Board

We propose to include the names of the authors according to the submission in the system.

(1) Dr. Adhi Iman Sulaiman, S.IP., M.Si,

Researcher and Lecturer of Communication Science Department, Jenderal Soedirman University

(2) Dra. Sri Weningsih, M.Si
Researcher and Lecturer of Indonesia Open University in Purwokerto, Central Java of Indonesia

(3) Dr. Toto Sugito, S.Sos., M.Si
Researcher and Lecturer of Communication Science Department, Jenderal Soedirman University

(4) Dr. Masrukin, S.Sos., M.Si
Researcher and Lecturer of Sociology Department, Jenderal Soedirman University

(5) Drs. Bambang Suswanto., M.Si
Researcher and Lecturer of Political Science Department , Jenderal Soedirman University

Thank you for your concern.

Best regards
Dr. Adhi Iman Sulaiman

Pada tanggal Rab, 6 Apr 2022 pukul 16.18 Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id> menulis:
Dear JPPW Editorial Board

We need a moment, | will quickly complete the author's name in the journal article before publication

Best Regard
Dr. Adhi Iman Sulaiman

Pada tanggal Rab, 6 Apr 2022 pukul 12.27 JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> menulis:
Dear Author
Please find the attached link of publication and pdf copy

https://journalppw.com/index.php/jppw/issue/view/26

On 04-Apr-2022, at 2:07 PM, JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Author
Your paper will publish with in 2 days.

On 04-Apr-2022, at 11:49 AM, Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

Dari: Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id>

Date: Rab, 30 Mar 2022 pukul 22.03

Subject: Fwd: You have paid for 'Publica. (USD 550/ INR 40500)' on Instamojo
To: JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id>

Date: Rab, 30 Mar 2022 pukul 22.00

Subject: Re: You have paid for 'Publica. (USD 550/ INR 40500)' on Instamojo
To: JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com>

Dear: Editor In Chief Journal of Positive Psychology & Wellbeing

We request information about our journal article entitled "Economic Empowerment Model in Harmonization and
Deradicalization of Islamic Boarding School", which is still in the process of being reviewed and can be published in
Journal of Positive Psychology & Wellbeing. We have also paid the publication fee on 22 Feb 2022.

Thank you for your attention and we ask for your confirmation.
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Best Regards
Dr. Adhi Iman Sulaiman
Researcher and Lecturer of Jenderal Soedirman University

Pada tanggal Rab, 23 Feb 2022 pukul 10.33 JPPW Editorial Board <jppweditor@gmail.com> menulis:
Dear Author
Send final copy of paper and in which issue you want to publish
2021 issue or 2022 issue.

On 23-Feb-2022, at 6:51 AM, Adhi Iman Sulaiman 1 <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Editor-In-Chief of Journal of Positive Psychology and Wellbeing

| have paid a publication fee for our article entitled " Economic Empowerment Model in Harmonization and
Deradicalization of Islamic Boarding School ". | attach proof of payment. Hopefully our article can be
processed for review and publication soon.

Best regards
Dr. Adhi Iman Sulaiman

---------- Forwarded message ---------
Dari: Instamojo <support@instamojo.com>
Date: Sel, 22 Feb 2022 pukul 22.14

Subject: You have paid for 'Publica. (USD 550/ INR 40500)' on Instamojo
To: <adhi.sulaiman@unsoed.ac.id>

iInstamojo

¥41937.24 Paid

PAYMENT DETAILS

Payment ID MOJ02222D05A41069866
Order Amount 340500

Convenience Fee 31437.24

Total Amount 341937.24

Paid for Publica. (USD 550/ INR 40500)
Paid To journalspublicationsrm

Reply to this email to get in touch with journalspublicationsrm.

Report an issue

Share this on social media [} €2 @)

- Do you own a business?
:- ) ) Sign Up Now
Collect payments using Instamojo

© 2022 Instamojo. All Rights Reserved.
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